REPUBLIC OF THE PHILIPPINES
Department Of Health

National Center for Mental Health

; c \ :'
BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE FOR INFRASTRUCTURE AND EQUIPMENT

RESOLUTION NO. 7B-2022

PROCUREMENT FOR THE SUPPLY, DELIVERY, COMMISSIONING AND TESTING OF VARIOUS
MEDICAL SUPPLIES AND EQUIPMENT CY2022

WHEREAS, the BAC instructed the End-User to review again the Technical Specifications
Approved Budget for the Contract, and conduct o market study of the remaining items that
NO BID was received then doing such they will adopt an Alternative Mode of Procurement
via Negotiated Procurement: Small Value Procurement;

UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

Minor Set, (1) kidney basin
8" (2) mosquito forceps
curve (2) mosquito forceps
straight (1) blade holder #3,
(1) needle holder, small (1)
iris scissor (1) Tissue Forcep
with T, (1) Soaking Tray, clear
plastic

SET Php2,300.00 Php184,000.00

TOTAL AMOUNT OF BID/S

Php184,000.00 |

TOTAL PRICE

ITEM / DESCRIPTION ITEM

CODE

OB Pack, (1) Surgical Scissor, RMSE Php23,000.00

1 Tissue Forcep, 2 straight 22-10

forcep, 1  round basin NO BID
(Standard Size), 1 kelly curve

forep) soaking tray, clear

plastic

| Php2300000 | |

ITEM ary | vom UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
CODE

RMSE 15 PIECE Php5,000.00 Php75,000.00
22-16
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UNIT PRICE

ary | uom
10 SET

Php2,300.00

TOTAL AMOUNT OF BID/S

ITEM / DESCRIPTION

Thermal Scanner with
Automatic Alcohol
Dispenser, for automatic
alcohol dispenser: Infrared
Detection, Motion Activated,
Content: 700ml., Low battery
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indication, easy battery
replacement (AA Size), No
wiring. For infrared Thermal
Scanner: Infrared
Measurement, Distance NO BID
Sensor, Speaker / buzzer,
alarm light, On / Off Button,
Mode Button, Indicator, USB
Port, Display, Response time:
0.5s, infrared measuring
range: 0°C - 40°C, weight:
227g., dimensions: 155 x 104
x 84mm, stand, infrared
thermal scanner

WHEREAS, on August 2, 2022, the Procurement Section received a letter from Mr. Ariel D. Bernardo,
RN, MGM (End-User), stating the re-evaluated technical specifications and cost estimated with
market study for the various medical equipment with NO BIDs;

WHEREAS, the BAC, thru its Secretariat, has undertaken the following activities:

1) Posted the Request for Quotation No. 8897870 dated August 5, 2022 simultaneously at the
PhilGEPS website, NCMH website and in conspicuous places within the premises of this
agency and set the deadline of submission of bids on August 11, 2022, 5:00 p.m.;

2) Requested quotations on the same date from suppliers of known qualifications:
(a) P.T. CERNA CORPORATION
(b) OPTIMEDEVICES AND REPAIR SERVICES
(c) PRIMEGOLD CARE TRADING
(d) CAIOMHE GENERAL MERCHANDISE

3) Received price quotations from P.T. CERNA CORPORATION, PRIMEGOLD CARE TRADING,
and CAIOMHE GENERAL MERCHANDISE, on August 11, 2022, along with the required
documents;

WHEREAS, the BAC opened the quotations submitted by the prospective bidders on August 12,
2022, and upon recommendation from the Technical Working Group and End-User who carefully

evaluated and reviewed the price quotations and documentary requirements submitted, checked
the Abstract of Quotation:

DOCUMENTARY REQUIREMENTS

CAIOMHE GENERAL MERCHANDISE

No. | Documents Required Evaluation
1. PhilGEPS registration number Complied
2 Mayor’s and Business Permit Complied
3. Income and Business Tax Return Complied
4. Omnibus Sworn Statement Complied
5. Secretary’s Certificate (if corporation) N/A
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PRIME GOLD CARE TRADING

No. | Documents Required Evaluation
1. PhilGEPS registration number Complied
2. Mayor’s and Business Permit Complied
3. Income and Business Tax Return Complied
4. Omnibus Sworn Statement Complied
5 Secretary’s Certificate (if corporation) N/A
PT CERNA CORPORATION
No. | Documents Required Evaluation
1. PhilGEPS registration number Complied
2. Mayor’'s and Business Permit Complied
3. Income and Business Tax Return Non-Complying
4, Omnibus Sworn Statement Non-Complying
5. Secretary’s Certificate (if corporation) N/A
ABSTRACT OF QUOTATION
be I Name of Participating Bidder
No. | @y | unit Hem Speclcations:, UNITPRICE | TOTALPRICE
Description CAIOMHE GENERAL MERCHANDISE PRIMEGOLD CARE TRADING
OB Pack, (1) Surgical Scissor, 1
Tissue Forcep, 2 Straight Forcep, UNIT PRICE: PHP 1,500.00 UNIT PRICE: PHP 2,300.00
1 7 set [1Round Basin (Standard Size), 1| PHP 3,000.00 PHP 21,000.00 TOTAL PRICE: PHP 10,500.00 TOTAL PRICE: PHP 16,100.00
Kelly Curve Forceps, Soaking BRAND / MODEL: NONE BRAND / MODEL: OLTEN
Tray clear plastic
Thermal Scanner with
Automatic Alcohol Dispenser,
For Automatic Alcohol
Dispenser: Infrared Detection,
Motion  Activated, Content:
700ml., Low Battery Indication,
Easy Battery Replacement {AA
size), h:o wiring. For in;rared UNIT PRICE: PHP 2,500
2 | 15 | piece |[nermal  scanner: Infrared| oo ono00 | PHP 75,000.00 TOTAL PRICE: PHP 52,500.00 NO BID
measurement, Distance Sensor, BRAND / MODEL: NONE
Speaker f Buzzer, Alarm Light,
ON / OFF Button, Mode Button,
Indicator, USB Port, Display,
Response time: 0.5s, Infrared
Measuring Range: 0°C - 40°C,
Weight: 227g., Dimensions: 155
x 104 x 84mm, Stand, Infrared
Thermal Scanner
Minor Set, {1) Kidney Basin 8"
(1) Mosquito Forceps (2) Curve
Forceps (2] Straight Forceps (1) UNIT PRICE: PHP 2,800.00 UNIT PRICE: PHP 3,080.00
3 60 set (Blade Holder #3, (1) Needle| PHP 3,100.00 | PHP 186,000.00 TOTAL PRICE: 168,000.00 TOTAL PRICE: 184,800.00
Holder (1) Iris Scissor (1) Tissue BRAND / MODEL: NONE BRAND / MODEL: OLTEN
Forcep, (1) Scaking Tray, clear
plastic

WHEREAS, on August 17, 2022, CAIOMHE GENERAL MERCHANDISE submitted their product
samples for product demonstration. It was evaluated at the BAC Conference Room, 10:00 am with
the presence of Ms. Regina M. Casanova - BAC Secretariat, Ms. Cherrie Anicia Gahol — TWG

(Financial), and Mr. Ariel Bernardo, RN — END USER/S.

PRODUCT DEMONSTRATION:

No.

BIDDER/S

Evaluation

1.

CAIOMHE GENERAL MERCHANDISE

Complied
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WHEREAS, the BAC found the offer of CAIOMHE GENERAL MERCHANDISE as the Lowest Calculated

and Responsive Bid;

NOW THEREFORE, we, the members of Bids and Awards Committee for Infrastructure Project and
Other Equipment, resolve as it is hereby resolved:

a. Torecommend to Award the items mentioned below to CAIOMHE GENERAL MERCHANDISE
being identified to be the Lowest Calculated and Responsive Bidder for the Supply, Delivery,
Commissioning and Testing of Various Medical Supplies and Equipment CY2022;

Automatic Alcohol Dispenser,
for automatic alcohol dispenser:
Infrared Detection, Motion
Activated, Content: 700ml, Low
battery indication, easy battery
replacement (AA Size), No
wiring. For infrared Thermal
Scanner: Infrared
Measurement, Distance Sensor,
Speaker / buzzer, alarm light,
On / Off Button, Mode Button,
Indicator, USB Port, Display,
Response time: 0.5s, infrared
measuring range: 0°C - 40°C,

ITEM / DESCRIPTION ITEM CODE | QTY uom UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
Minor Set, (1) kidney basin 8" | RMSE22-09 60 SET Php2,800.00 Php168,000.00
(2) mosquito forceps curve (2)
mosquito forceps straight (1)
blade holder #3, (1) needle
holder, small (1) iris scissor (1}

Tissue Forcep with T, (1) Soaking
Tray, clear plastic
TOTAL AMOUNT OF BID/S | Php168,000.00

ITEM / DESCRIPTION ITEM CODE | QTY Uom UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
OB Pack, (1) Surgical Scissor, 1 | RMSE 22-10 7 SET Php1,500.00 Php10,500.00
Tissue Forcep, 2 straight forcep,

1 round basin (Standard Size), 1
kelly curve forep) soaking tray,
clear plastic
TOTAL AMOUNT OF BID/S | Php10,500.00

ITEM / DESCRIPTION ITEM CODE Qry UomM UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

Thermal Scanner with RMSE 22-16 15 PIECE Php3,500.00 Php52,500.00
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weight: 227g., dimensions: 155
X 104 x 84mm, stand, infrared
thermal scanner

TOTAL AMOUNT OF BID/S | Php52,500.00

b. To recommend to the Medical Center Chief il of the National Center for Mental
Health the approval of this resolution and subsequently issue the Notice of Award to
the above winning bidder; and

c. To effect the posting of the Notice of Award at the PhilGEPS and NCMH website, and
in conspicuous places within the NCMH premises.

RESOLVED, at the BAC Conference Room, National Center for Mental Health, Mandaluyong City this
August 17, 2022.

BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE
FOR INFRASTRUCTURE AND EQUIPMENT

SOLIDAD G. YAMBAO, MGM JANE P. MN RN, MPM
Member Member
. LR
RAYMUND GIOVANNI iLLO, DMD, MMHoA
Memgber
W

JONNELLY ANN WEST RMT, MMHoA
e-Chairpevson

ALDENC.C , MID, FPPA, IFAPA (Life), MMHo
Chairpersbn, Bid and Awards Commi'%y

NOEL V. REYES, MD, FPPA, MIMHOA
Medfical Center Chief Il
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